

This is a recap of our bid opening. It is for information purposes only and does in no way constitute an award. For questions concerning these results, please email us at purchasing2@amarillo.gov

BID NO. 4299
PURCHASE OF PICNIC TABLES, TRASH RECEPTACLES
JANUARY 31, 2013

PROJECT ESTIMATE \$

COMPANY NAME	BID BOND	ADDENDUM	AMOUNT
Playwell Group		✓	26,144.09
M Mrs Jira Supply			NO BID
All Aquatics + Kids play		✓	31,197.09
Belson Outdoors		✓	24,907.50
Kids Place Designs		✓	23,941.00
Inter			NO BID
Playgrounds Today		✓	26,865.00
Diversified Metal Fabricators		✓	24,814.00
Experplay		✓	23,605.00
Products Unlimited		x	27,470.00 27,460.00
Recreation Brands Group		✓	32,145.41
BSN Sports		✓	partial
Best Litter Receptacles		✓	28,592.98
RJ Thomas Mfg.		✓	19,629.91
All Aquatics Kids Play		✓	31,197.09
Playgrounds Etc		✓	30,423.00
K-LOG		✓	34,921.18
Hunter-Knepshield		✓	complete bid no total
Mayfield Pipe Co			NO BID
Waste Equip			NO BID

CITY OF AMARILLO PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

BID OPENING SIGN IN SHEET

DATE: JANUARY 31, 2013

PLEASE READ:

“Pursuant to Local Government Code 252.041 we will open & read aloud all bids that are due to open today. In no way does reading these bids indicate that the bids received are complete and correct. This will be determined only in the bid evaluation phase.”

NAME Kim Mayes COMPANY COA

NAME Carol Hill COMPANY COA

NAME _____ COMPANY _____

NAME _____ COMPANY _____